OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

OPENING DATE
AUGUST 9, 2012

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4186

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

A. B & S Transport, Inc.

B. Kauffman Tire

C. North Gateway Tire Co.

D. Ziegler Tire & Supply

ITEM # "A" "B" "C"
1 $ 84.87 $ 76.00 $ 86.65
2 $ 112.88 $ 85.00 $ 84.00
3 $ 120.23 $ 161.00 $ 16250
4 $ 120.50 $ 126.00 $ 97.00
5 $ 12255 $ 131.00 $ 139.30
6 $ 122.00 $ 126.00 $ 116.05
7 $ 11595 $ 126.00 $ 14155
8 $ 149.83 $ 176.00 $ 179.90
9 $ 12371 $ 126.00 $ 126.20
10 $ 264.29 $ 186.00 $ 220.00
11 $ 277.25 $ 225.00 $ 242.00
12 $ 284.69 $ 219.00 $ 242.00
13 $ 310.86 $ 238.00 $ 271.00
14 $ 114.23 $ 145.00 $ 150.00
15 $ 299.00 $ 246.00 $ 275.00
16 $ 379.93 $ 356.00 $ 320.00
17 $ 309.00 $ 33421 $ 325.00
18 $ 338.00 $ 285.00 $ 365.00
19 $ 38952 $ 315.00 $ 348.00
20 $ 53515 $  455.00 $ 520.00

alt. 20 $ 589.25
21 $ 43161 $ 426.00 $ 450.00
alt. 21 $  494.69

22 $ 479.42 $ 47117 $  460.00
23 $ 525.44 $ 435.00 $ 545.00
24 $ 520.50 $ 60281 NO BID
25 NO BID $ 79.00 $ 72.00
26 $ 127.46 NO BID $ 85.00
27 $ 21298 NO BID $ 100.00
28 NO BID $ 85.00 $ 85.00
29 $ 185.07 $ 169.00 $ 169.00
30 NO BID $ 515.00 NO BID
31 $ 1,163.49 $ 1,009.00 $ 1,425.00
32 $ 675.78 $ 600.00 $ 665.00
33 NO BID $ 25.00 $ 32.00
34 NO BID $ 65.00 $ 70.00
35 $ 116.49 $ 76.00 $ 80.00
36 $ 146.97 $ 147.00 $ 196.00
37 NO BID NO BID $ 310.00
38 $ 37592 $ 415.00 $ 370.00
39 $ 37212 NO BID $ 300.00
40 NO BID $ 725.00 $ 670.00
41 NO BID NO BID $ 770.00
42 $ 69255 $ 545.00 $ 575.00
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