
 

OHIO TURNPIKE AND  INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
  682 PROSPECT STREET

BEREA, OHIO  44017

OPENING DATE
AUGUST 26, 2013

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4204

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

 A.   JAM Best One Tire and Service

D.   Smiley Tire & Retreading

ITEM # "A" "B" "C" "D" "E"

1 88.95$         85.95$         86.50$         86.80$         91.95$         
2 188.00$       158.50$       146.00$       160.35$       124.66$       
3 104.66$       113.00$       98.00$         120.44$       116.85$       
4 109.00$       139.50$       95.00$         137.44$       115.80$       
5 121.00$       106.00$       109.00$       123.04$       149.61$       
6 150.00$       129.00$       135.04$       142.12$       111.11$       

Alt. 6 136.92$       
7 219.00$       185.00$       169.00$       179.71$       203.22$       
8 149.00$       132.00$       117.00$       136.30$       121.24$       
9 257.46$       189.00$       205.00$       241.67$       257.46$       
10 282.14$       314.00$       225.00$       256.11$       287.14$       
11 132.00$       136.50$       121.76$       123.01$       NO BID
12 284.12$       219.00$       254.93$       294.96$       289.72$       

Alt. 12 275.00$       
13 417.18$       327.00$       312.83$       400.19$       347.04$       

Alt. 13 365.00$       
14 519.71$       615.00$       448.00$       574.43$       519.71$       

Alt. 14 550.00$       
15 541.93$       337.00$       367.48$       433.44$       419.08$       
16 506.30$       375.00$       395.35$       630.32$       509.23$       
17 76.00$         85.00$         68.00$         83.84$         NO BID
18 77.00$         185.00$       79.00$         109.90$       NO BID
19 137.00$       175.00$       95.00$         164.25$       NO BID
20 84.00$         89.00$         84.00$         96.42$         NO BID
21 189.00$       175.00$       160.00$       190.00$       303.36$       
22 839.00$       515.00$       350.00$       850.00$       NO BID
23 1,599.80$    995.00$       975.00$       1,317.00$    1,092.82$    

Alt. 23 1,233.00$    
24 833.00$       565.00$       550.00$       890.00$       601.11$       

Alt. 24 568.00$       
25 42.00$         36.00$         20.00$         31.00$         NO BID
26 73.00$         73.00$         50.00$         92.00$         NO BID
27 134.00$       135.00$       80.00$         120.23$       NO BID
28 173.19$       165.00$       130.00$       129.85$       NO BID
29 299.82$       295.00$       325.00$       602.00$       NO BID
30 489.00$       399.00$       370.00$       420.00$       440.47$       
31 337.00$       299.00$       250.00$       325.00$       NO BID
32 723.87$       595.00$       540.00$       652.00$       633.18$       

Alt. 32 670.00$       
33 1,557.00$    715.00$       800.00$       922.00$       NO BID
34 712.07$       520.00$       475.00$       638.00$       597.66$       

TERMS NET NET NET NET NET

 B.   Kauffman Tire

E.   Ziegler Tire & Supply

C.   North Gateway Tire Co.
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