

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

BID INVITATION NO. 4301

FOR FURNISHING ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE/ETHANOL BLEND

OPENING DATE - JULY 19, 2017

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>GROUP I AND GROUP III</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>GROUP II AND GROUP IV</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>TERMS</u>
Lykins Energy Solutions 5163 Wolfpen Pleasant Hill Road Milford, Ohio 45150	KUNKLE - DIESEL	-0.0275	AMHERST - DIESEL	-.0215	NET
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	-0.0115	AMHERST - GASOLINE	-.0255	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	-0.0295	BOSTON - DIESEL	-.0215	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	-0.0255	BOSTON - GASOLINE	-.0211	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	-0.0295	HIRAM - DIESEL	-.0188	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	-0.0258	HIRAM - GASOLINE	-.0251	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	-0.0225	CANFIELD - DIESEL	-.0191	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	-0.0215	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	-.0115	
	Petroleum Traders Corporation 7120 Pointe Inverness Way Fort Wayne, IN 46804	KUNKLE - DIESEL	-.0204	AMHERST - DIESEL	
KUNKLE - GASOLINE		+.0300	AMHERST - GASOLINE	+.0023	
SWANTON - DIESEL		-.0354	BOSTON - DIESEL	-.0033	
SWANTON - GASOLINE		-.0201	BOSTON - GASOLINE	+.0302	
ELMORE - DIESEL		-.0333	HIRAM - DIESEL	-.0012	
ELMORE - GASOLINE		-.0166	HIRAM - GASOLINE	+.0037	
CASTALIA - DIESEL		-.0177	CANFIELD - DIESEL	-.0175	
CASTALIA - GASOLINE		+.0303	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	+.0231	

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

BID INVITATION NO. 4301

FOR FURNISHING ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE/ETHANOL BLEND

OPENING DATE - JULY 19, 2017

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>GROUP I AND GROUP III</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>GROUP II AND GROUP IV</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>TERMS</u>
Ports Petroleum 1337 Blachleyville Wooster, Ohio 44691	KUNKLE - DIESEL	-.0234	AMHERST - DIESEL	-.0169	NET
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	-.0091	AMHERST - GASOLINE	-.0170	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	-.0234	BOSTON - DIESEL	-.0169	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	-.0091	BOSTON - GASOLINE	-.0170	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	-.0234	HIRAM - DIESEL	-.0192	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	-.0101	HIRAM - GASOLINE	-.0170	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	-.0191	CANFIELD - DIESEL	-.0192	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	-.0101	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	-.0170	
	Great Lakes Petroleum 4500 Renaissance parkway Cleveland, Ohio 44128	KUNKLE - DIESEL	-.012	AMHERST - DIESEL	
KUNKLE - GASOLINE		-.013	AMHERST - GASOLINE	-.013	
SWANTON - DIESEL		-.012	BOSTON - DIESEL	-.012	
SWANTON - GASOLINE		-.013	BOSTON - GASOLINE	-.013	
ELMORE - DIESEL		-.012	HIRAM - DIESEL	-.012	
ELMORE - GASOLINE		-.013	HIRAM - GASOLINE	-.013	
CASTALIA - DIESEL		-.012	CANFIELD - DIESEL	-.012	
CASTALIA - GASOLINE		-.013	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	-.013	

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

BID INVITATION NO. 4301

FOR FURNISHING ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE/ETHANOL BLEND

OPENING DATE - JULY 19, 2017

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>GROUP I AND GROUP III</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>GROUP II AND GROUP IV</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>TERMS</u>
Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, Inc. 1025 Airport Parkway, SW Gainesville, Georgia 30501-6813	KUNKLE - DIESEL	-.0085	AMHERST - DIESEL	-.0042	.0020%
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	+.0293	AMHERST - GASOLINE	-.0038	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	-.0230	BOSTON - DIESEL	-.0078	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	-.0136	BOSTON - GASOLINE	-.0028	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	-.0242	HIRAM - DIESEL	+.0009	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	-.0141	HIRAM - GASOLINE	-.0109	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	+.0158	CANFIELD - DIESEL	+.0082	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	+.0543	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	+.0062	
RKA Petroleum Companies, Inc. 28340 Wick Road Romulus, Michigan 48174	KUNKLE - DIESEL	+.0317	AMHERST - DIESEL	+.0381	NET
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	+.0412	AMHERST - GASOLINE	+.0338	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	+.0227	BOSTON - DIESEL	+.0381	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	+.0136	BOSTON - GASOLINE	+.0430	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	+.0199	HIRAM - DIESEL	+.0392	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	+.0108	HIRAM - GASOLINE	+.0349	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	+.0295	CANFIELD - DIESEL	+.0502	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	+.0372	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	+.0657	

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017
PROCUREMENT SECTION**

BID INVITATION NO. 4301

FOR FURNISHING ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE/ETHANOL BLEND

OPENING DATE - JULY 19, 2017

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>GROUP I AND GROUP III</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>GROUP II AND GROUP IV</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>TERMS</u>
Hightowers Petroleum Company 3577 Commerce Drive Middletown, Ohio 45005	KUNKLE - DIESEL	+.0380	AMHERST - DIESEL	+.0380	NET
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	+.0400	AMHERST - GASOLINE	+.0400	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	+.0380	BOSTON - DIESEL	+.0380	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	+.0400	BOSTON - GASOLINE	+.0400	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	+.0380	HIRAM - DIESEL	+.0380	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	+.0400	HIRAM - GASOLINE	+.0400	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	+.0380	CANFIELD - DIESEL	+.0380	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	+.0400	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	+.0400	
	Corrigan Oil Co. No. II 775 N. Second Street Brighton, Michigan 48116	KUNKLE - DIESEL	+.0641	AMHERST - DIESEL	
KUNKLE - GASOLINE		+.0641	AMHERST - GASOLINE	NO BID	
SWANTON - DIESEL		+.0641	BOSTON - DIESEL	NO BID	
SWANTON - GASOLINE		+.0641	BOSTON - GASOLINE	NO BID	
ELMORE - DIESEL		+.0641	HIRAM - DIESEL	NO BID	
ELMORE - GASOLINE		+.0641	HIRAM - GASOLINE	NO BID	
CASTALIA - DIESEL		+.0641	CANFIELD - DIESEL	NO BID	
CASTALIA - GASOLINE		+.0641	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	NO BID	

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION
 682 PROSPECT STREET
 BEREA, OHIO 44017
 PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4301

FOR FURNISHING ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL AND UNLEADED GASOLINE/ETHANOL BLEND

OPENING DATE - JULY 19, 2017

<u>BIDDER</u>	<u>GROUP I AND GROUP III</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>GROUP II AND GROUP IV</u>	<u>PRICE DIFFERENTIAL</u>	<u>TERMS</u>
Universal Oil Inc. 265 Jefferson Avenue Cleveland, Ohio 44113	KUNKLE - DIESEL	NO BID	AMHERST - DIESEL	+0.038	NET
	KUNKLE - GASOLINE	NO BID	AMHERST - GASOLINE	+0.048	
	SWANTON - DIESEL	NO BID	BOSTON - DIESEL	+0.053	
	SWANTON - GASOLINE	NO BID	BOSTON - GASOLINE	+0.048	
	ELMORE - DIESEL	NO BID	HIRAM - DIESEL	+0.038	
	ELMORE - GASOLINE	NO BID	HIRAM - GASOLINE	+0.048	
	CASTALIA - DIESEL	NO BID	CANFIELD - DIESEL	+0.053	
	CASTALIA - GASOLINE	NO BID	CANFIELD - GASOLINE	+0.048	