OHIO TURNPIKE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

OPENING DATE
JULY 8, 2008

BID INVITATION NUMBER 4098

FOR FURNISHING PNEUMATIC TIRES

A. Goodyear Tire & Rubber
B. North Gateway Tire Co., Inc.
C. Ziegler Tire and Supply

ITEM # "A" "B" “C"
1 $ 62.29 $ 75.00 NO BID
2 $ 67.69 $ 60.00 NO BID
3 $ 121.28 $ 177.00 NO BID
4 $ 109.66 $ 124.00 NO BID
5 $ 89.24 $ 115.00 NO BID
6 $ 106.36 $ 133.00 $ 93.60
7 $ 182.64 $ 200.00 NO BID
8 $ 107.60 $ 132.00 NO BID
9 $ 226.37 $ 195.00 $ 158.00
10 $ 19731 $ 201.00 $ 205.00
11 $ 226.37 $ 182.00 $ 189.00
12 $ 22551 $ 202.00 $ 178.00
13 $ 19744 $ 235.00 $ 192.00
14 $ 24941 $ 255.00 $ 221.00
15 $ 21593 $ 236.00 $ 213.00
16 $ 216.93 $ 258.00 $ 225.00
17 $ 223.46 $ 266.00 $ 250.00
18 $ 37453 $ 409.00 $ 325.00
19 $ 31381 $ 321.00 $ 275.00
20 $ 299.68 $ 331.00 $ 309.00
21 $ 227.28 $ 357.00 $ 272.00
22 $ 33317 $ 395.00 $ 272.00
23 $ 33317 $ 298.00 NO BID
24 $ 75.35 $ 60.00 NO BID
25 $ 98.86 $ 66.00 NO BID
26 $ 186.25 $ 90.00 NO BID
27 $ 152.06 $ 161.00 NO BID
28 $ 83.86 $ 72.00 NO BID
29 NO BID $ 150.00 NO BID
30 NO BID $ 475.00 NO BID
31 $ 476.20 $ 475.00 NO BID
32 NO BID $ 30.00 NO BID
33 NO BID $ 45.00 NO BID
34 NO BID $ 110.00 NO BID
35 NO BID $ 65.00 NO BID
36 NO BID $ 105.00 NO BID
37 NO BID $ 250.00 NO BID
38 NO BID $ 250.00 NO BID
39 NO BID $ 200.00 NO BID
40 NO BID $ 360.00 NO BID
41 NO BID $ 575.00 NO BID
42 NO BID $ 390.00 NO BID
TERMS NET NET NET

The Goodyear Tire & Rubber Company Awarded Items 1, 5, 21 & 27 on August 21, 2008.

Ziegler Tire & Supply Co. Awarded Items 9, 11, 17 & 22 on August 21, 2008.

North Gateway Tire Co., Inc. Awarded Items 2, 10, 23, 24, 25, 26, 28, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35 36, 39 & 42 on August 21,
2008.



