

**OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION**  
682 PROSPECT STREET  
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

**INVITATION NUMBER 4333**

**FOR FURNISHING**

**LAWN CARE SERVICES AT FOURTEEN (14) OHIO TURNPIKE SERVICE PLAZAS**

**OPENING DATE - JANUARY 29, 2019**

<b><u>BIDDER</u></b>		<b><u>ITEM 1 TOTAL MOWING</u></b>	<b><u>ITEM 2 TOTAL FERTILIZATION</u></b>
<b>Asturi Landscape Group LLC</b> 32860 Pin Oak Parkway Avon lake, Ohio 44012	<b>GROUP A</b>	\$ 14,364.90	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP B</b>	\$ 13,929.00	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP C</b>	\$ 11,143.20	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP D</b>	\$ 8,357.40	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP E</b>	\$ 8,357.40	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP F</b>	\$ 8,357.40	\$ 280.00
	<b>GROUP G</b>	\$ 11,143.20	\$ 280.00
<b>Ace Lawn Care &amp; Landscaping LLC</b> 417 Race Street Clyde, Ohio 43410	<b>GROUP A</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP B</b>	\$ 23,955.00	\$ 200.00
	<b>GROUP C</b>	\$ 20,040.00	\$ 250.00
	<b>GROUP D</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP E</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP F</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP G</b>	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Exceptional Landscaping LLC</b> 153 Butternut Drive Amherst, Ohio 44001	<b>GROUP A</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP B</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP C</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP D</b>	\$ 14,400.00	NO BID
	<b>GROUP E</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP F</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP G</b>	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Turfscape, Inc.</b> 8490 Tower Drive Twinsburg, Ohio 44087	<b>GROUP A</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP B</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP C</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP D</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP E</b>	\$ 6,030.00	\$ 260.00
	<b>GROUP F</b>	\$ 9,270.00	\$ 245.00
	<b>GROUP G</b>	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Todd's Envirosapes, Inc.</b> 7727 Paris Avenue Louisville, Ohio 44641	<b>GROUP A</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP B</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP C</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP D</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP E</b>	\$ 11,340.00	\$ 364.00
	<b>GROUP F</b>	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>GROUP G</b>	\$ 13,380.00	\$ 324.00

**\*\*GROUPS A, B, C, D, F, & G AWARDED TO: ASTURI LANDSCAPE GROUP**  
**\*\*GROUP E AWARDED TO: TURFSCAPE, INC.**