BIDDER

Any Domestic Work, Inc.

6683 State Road
Parma, Ohio 44134

King General Cleaning
3343 Ridgeway St.
Pittsburgh, PA 15213

NDR Facilities LLC
3239 Astor Ave.
Toledo, Ohio 43614

OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION

682 PROSPECT STREET
BEREA, OHIO 44017

PROCUREMENT SECTION

BID INVITATION NO. 4459

JANITORIAL SERVICES AT EIGHT (8) OHIO TURNPIKE AND INFRASTRUCTURE COMMISSION MAINTENANCE BUILDINGS

ITEM 1
PER VISIT
KUNKLE

$74.00

NO BID

$713.56

OPENING DATE: JULY 26, 2024

ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4 ITEM 5 ITEM 6 ITEM 7
PER VISIT PER VISIT PER VISIT PER VISIT PER VISIT PER VIST
SWANTON ELMORE CASTALIA AMHERST BOSTON HIRAM
$74.00 $90.00 $74.00 $74.00 $74.00 $90.00
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $72.65 $92.00
$713.56 $713.56 $713.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID

ITEM 8 TOTAL TERMS
PER VISIT PER VISIT/
CANFIELD PER LOCATION
$74.00 $624.00 N/A
$72.65 $237.30 6%
NO BID $2,854.24 5%
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